Serving You

Council -
Supplementary agenda No.1

A meeting of the Council will be held on:

Date: 25 January 2018

Time: 7.30pm

Venue: St George's Centre, Pembroke Road, Chatham Maritime, Chatham
ME4 4UH

Items

13 Council Tax Reduction Scheme (Pages

3 - 446)
Please find enclosed Appendices 1-7 to the report.

For further information please contact Julie Keith, Head of Democratic Services
on Telephone: 01634 332760 or Email: democratic.services@medway.qov.uk

Date: 17 January 2018

This agenda and reports are
available on our website
www.medway.gov.uk

A summary of this information can be made available in other formats from 01634 333333

If you have any questions about this meeting and you want to speak to someone in your own language please ring 01634 335577

TiEm 331780 aradl 331782 UATet 331784 @85S 331841 3l 331785 Pycokuin 332374
==-4 331781 & 331783 Polski 332373 GIRTFY 331786 gt 331840 Lietuvigkai 332372






AgenBRIRAR 13

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 1305
COUNCIL TAX, ENGLAND

The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Amendment) (England)
Regulations 2017

Made - - - - 19th December 2017
Laid before Parliament 21st December 2017

Coming into force in accordance with regulation 1(1) and (2)

The Secretary of State makes the following Regulations in exercise of the powers conferred by
section 113(1) and (2) of, and paragraphs 2 and 5 of Schedule 1A to, the Local Government
Finance Act 1992(a):

Part 1

General

Citation, commencement and application

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Amendment)
(England) Regulations 2017 and, save as provided in paragraph (2), come into force on 12th
January 2018.

(2) Regulations 10, 11 and 14(b) come into force on 6th December 2018.

(3) Parts 3 and 4 of these Regulations apply in relation to council tax reduction schemes(b)
made by billing authorities(c) for financial years beginning on or after 1st April 2018.

Part 2

Date for Revisions to, or Replacement of, a Scheme

Amendment of the Local Government Finance Act 1992

2. In Schedule 1A (council tax reduction schemes: England) to the Local Government Finance
Act 1992, in paragraph 5(2) (revisions to and replacement of scheme) for “31 January” substitute
“11 March”.

(a) 1992 c.14. Section 113(1) and (2) were amended by paragraphs 2 and 9(a) of Schedule 1 to the Local Government Act 1999
(c.27); paragraphs 40 and 52 of Schedule 7 to the Local Government Act 2003 (c.26); section 80 of the Localism Act 2011
(c.20), and S.I. 2013/2597. Schedule 1A was inserted by Schedule 4 to the Local Government Finance Act 2012 (c.17).

(b) See section 13A(9) of the Local Government Finance Act 1992 for the definition of “council tax reduction scheme”. Section
13A was amended by section 10 of the Local Government Finance Act 2012.

(c) See section 1(2) of the Local Government Finance Act 1992 for the definition of “billing authority”.


wayne.hemingway
Typewritten Text
Appendix 1


Part 3

Amendment of Prescribed Requirements

Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements) (England)
Regulations 2012

3. The Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed Requirements) (England) Regulations
2012(a) are amended in accordance with this Part.

4. In regulation 2(1) (interpretation)—

(a) at the appropriate place in the alphabetical order, insert—

13113

approved blood scheme” means a scheme established or approved by the Secretary of
State, or trust established with funds provided by the Secretary of State, for the purpose
of providing compensation in respect of a person having been infected from
contaminated blood products;”;

13113

the London Emergencies Trust” means the company of that name (number
09928465) incorporated on 23rd December 2015 and the registered charity of that name
(number 1172307) established on 28th March 2017;”;

11173

the Scottish Infected Blood Support Scheme” means the scheme of that name
administered by the Common Services Agency (constituted under section 10 of the
National Health Service (Scotland) Act 1978(b));”;

13113

the We Love Manchester Emergency Fund” means the registered charity of that name
(number 1173260) established on 30th May 2017;”;

(b) in the definition of “main phase employment and support allowance”, after “2007” insert
“or the applicant is a member of the work-related activity group”;

(c) in the definition of “member of the work-related activity group”, for “claimant” substitute
“person”;

(d) in the definition of “qualifying person”, after “Caxton Foundation” insert “, the Scottish
Infected Blood Support Scheme, an approved blood scheme, the London Emergencies
Trust, the We Love Manchester Emergency Fund”.

5. In regulation 8 (households), in paragraph (2), in sub-paragraph (a) after “of that Act,” insert
“or section 81(2) of the Social Services and Well-being (Wales) Act 2014 (ways in which looked
after children are to be accommodated and maintained)(c)”.

6. Schedule 1 (pensioners: matters that must be included in an authority’s scheme) is amended in
accordance with regulations 7 to 11.

7. In Part 2 (applicable amounts for the purposes of calculating eligibility for a reduction under
an authority’s scheme and amount of reduction), in paragraph 6 (applicable amounts)—
(a) for sub-paragraph (1)(b), substitute—

“(b) an amount determined in accordance with paragraph 2 of that Schedule in respect
of up to two individuals who are either children or young persons and who are
members of his family;”;

(b) after sub-paragraph (1), insert—

“(1A) For the purposes of sub-paragraph (1)(b) as it applies apart from sub-paragraph
(1C), where the family includes more than two individuals who are either children or young
persons and under paragraph 2 of that Schedule a different amount applies to different

(a) S.I. 2012/2885; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 2012/3085, S.I. 2013/3181, S.I. 2014/107, S.I 2014/448, S.I.
2014/3312, S.1. 2015/2041 and S.I. 2016/1262.

(b) 1978 c. 29; section 10 deals with the establishment of the Common Services Agency, to which the Secretary of State may
delegate functions.

(¢) 2014 anaw 4.



individuals, the two amounts to be included in the applicable amount shall be those that
result in the greatest possible total amount.

(1B) Sub-paragraph (1C) applies where—

(a) (whether or not as part of a tax credit couple as defined in section 3(5A) of the Tax
Credits Act 2002) the applicant has an award of child tax credit (whether or not
any amount is payable by way of such credit) in respect of a child or young person
who is a member of his family; and

(b) the total amount to be included in the applicable amount under sub-paragraph
(1)(b) as substituted by sub-paragraph (1C) would be higher than the total amount
that would be included under paragraph (1)(b) apart from sub-paragraph (1C).

(1C) Where this paragraph applies, for sub-paragraph (1)(b) substitute—

(b) an amount determined in accordance with paragraph 2 of that Schedule in respect
of any child or young person who is a member of his family and in respect of
whom the individual element of child tax credit has been included in the
determination of the maximum rate of that credit;”.

8.In Part 3 (maximum council tax reduction for the purposes of calculating eligibility for a
reduction under an Authority’s scheme and amount of reduction), in paragraph 8 (non-dependant
deductions), in—

(a) sub-paragraph (1)(a), for “£11.55” substitute “£11.90”;
(b) sub-paragraph (1)(b), for “£3.80” substitute “£3.90”;
(c) sub-paragraph (2)(a), for “£196.95” substitute “£202.85”;

(d) sub-paragraph (2)(b), for “£196.95”, “£341.40” and “£7.65” substitute “£202.85”,
“£351.65” and “£7.90” respectively;

(e) sub-paragraph (2)(c), for “£341.40”, “£424.20” and “£9.65” substitute “£351.65”,
“£436.90”, “£9.95” respectively;

(f) sub-paragraph (9)(b), after “the Caxton Foundation” insert “, the Scottish Infected Blood
Support Scheme, an approved blood scheme, the London Emergencies Trust, the We
Love Manchester Emergency Fund”;

(g) sub-paragraph (10)(a), after “the Caxton Foundation” insert “, the Scottish Infected Blood
Support Scheme, an approved blood scheme, the London Emergencies Trust, the We
Love Manchester Emergency Fund”;

(h) after sub-paragraph (10)(f), insert—

“(g) any payment made under, or by, a trust which is approved by the Secretary of State
and which is established for the purpose of giving relief and assistance to a
disabled person whose disability was caused by their mother having taken a
preparation containing the drug known as Thalidomide during her pregnancy.”.

9. Part 6 (income and capital for the purposes of calculating eligibility for a reduction under an
Authority’s scheme and amount of reduction) is amended as follows—
(a) in paragraph 16 (meaning of “income”)—
(i) for sub-paragraph (1)(m), substitute—
“(m)a pension paid by a government to victims of National Socialist persecution;”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (2), after “sub-paragraph (1)” where it first appears insert “, or
retirement pension income to which section 16(1)(za) to (e) of the State Pension
Credit Act 2002 applies(a),”;

(iii) after sub-paragraph (4)(d), insert—

(a) 2002 c. 16.



“(e) section 14 of the Pensions Act 2014 (pension sharing: reduction in sharer’s section
4 pension)(a);

(f) section 45B or 55B of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992
(reduction in additional pension in Category A retirement pension and shared
additional pension: pension sharing)(b).”;

(b) in paragraph 21 (earnings of self-employed earners), in sub-paragraph (2)—
(1) in paragraph (b)(i), for “section 26(1)” substitute “section 26 or 26A”;
(i1) in paragraph (d)(iv), at the end omit “or”;
(iii) in paragraph (d)(v), after “2006” insert—

113

or

(vi) the persons concerned where the payment is for the provision of
accommodation to meet that person’s needs for care and support under section
35 or 36 of the Social Services and Well-being (Wales) Act 2014
(respectively, duty and power to meet care and support needs of an adult)(c);

(da) any payment or part of a payment made by a local authority in accordance with
section 26A of the Children (Scotland) Act 1995 (duty to provide continuing care)
to a person (“A”) which A passes on to the applicant where A—

(i) was formerly in the applicant’s care;
(i1) is aged 16 or over; and
(iii) continues to live with the applicant;

(db) any payments made to an applicant under section 73(1)(b) of the Children and
Young People (Scotland) Act 2014 (kinship care assistance: further provisions)(d);

>

(c) in paragraph 22 (notional income), in sub-paragraph (6), for “maximum amount of
income which may be withdrawn from the fund” substitute “rate of the annuity which
may have been purchased with the fund”;

(d) in paragraph 25 (treatment of childcare charges), in sub-paragraph (10)(c) for
“applicant’s applicable amount would include the support component on account of the
other member having limited capability for work or the other member of the couple
would be” substitute “other member of the couple would be a member of the support
group or’.

10. In Part 7 (extended reductions), in paragraph 43 (continuing reductions where state pension
credit is claimed)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)(c)(i), omit “or, if his entitlement to income-based jobseeker’s
allowance or income-related employment and support allowance continued beyond that
age, has attained the age of 65”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (2)(a)(ii), omit “or the age of 65”.

11.In Part 8 (when entitlement begins and change of circumstances), in paragraph 46 (date
when change of circumstances is to take effect), in sub-paragraph (10), omit paragraph (a).

12. In Schedule 2 (applicable amounts)—

(a) for paragraph 1 (personal allowance), substitute—

“1. The amount specified for the purposes of paragraph 6(1)(a) of Schedule 1 is—

(a)
(b)
()
(d)

2014 c. 19.
1992 c. 4.
2014 anaw 4.
2014 asp. 8.



(a) prior to 6th December 2018, the amount specified in column (2) of Table 1 below
in respect of each person or couple referred to in column (1) of that Table;

(b) on or after 6th December 2018, the amount specified in column (2) of Table 2
below in respect of each person or couple referred to in column (1) of that Table.

Table 1

Column (1)
Person, couple or polygamous marriage

Column (2)
Amount

(1) Single applicant or lone parent—

(a) aged under 65;

(b) aged 65 or over.

(2) Couple—

(a) both members aged under 65;

(b) one or both members aged 65 or over

(3) If the applicant is a member of a
polygamous marriage and none of the members
of the marriage has attained the age of 65—

(a) for the applicant and the other party to the
marriage;

(b) for each additional spouse who is a member
of the same household as the applicant.

(4) If the applicant is a member of a
polygamous marriage and one or more
members of the marriage are aged 65 or over—
(a) for the applicant and the other party to the
marriage;

(b) for each additional spouse who is a member
of the same household as the applicant.

Table 2

(a) £163.00;
(b) £176.40.

(a) £248.80;
(b) £263.80.

(a) £248.80;

(b) £85.80.

(a) £263.80;

(b) £87.40.

Column (1)
Person, couple or polygamous marriage

Column (2)
Amount

(1) Single applicant or lone parent who has
attained pensionable age

(2) Couple and one or both members have
attained pensionable age

(3) If the applicant is a member of a
polygamous marriage and one or more
members of the marriage have attained
pensionable age —

(a) for the applicant and the other party to the
marriage;

(b) for each additional spouse who is a member
of the same household as the applicant.

£176.40.

£263.80.

(a) £263.80;

(b) £87.40.”;

(b) in Part 4 (amounts of premium specified in Part 3) in the second column of the Table—

(1) in paragraph (1)(a) and (b)(i) for “£62.45” substitute “£64.30”;
(i1) in paragraph (1)(b)(ii) for “£124.90” substitute “£128.60”;
(iii) in paragraph (2) for “£24.78” substitute “£25.48”;
(iv) in paragraph (3) for “£60.90” substitute “£62.86”;

(v) in paragraph (4) for “£34.95” substitute “£36.00”.



13. In Schedule 3 (amount of alternative maximum council tax reduction) in paragraph 1, in
column (1) of the Table—

(a) for “£194.95” (twice) substitute “£201.00”;
(b) for “£252.50” substitute “£260.00”.
14. Schedule 5 (amounts to be disregarded in the calculation of income other than earnings) is
amended as follows—
(a) in paragraph 1, for sub-paragraph (1)(g) substitute—
“(g) a pension paid by a government to victims of National Socialist persecution.”;
(b) in paragraph 11, in sub-paragraph (b), after “65” insert “or, if it was higher at the time,
pensionable age”.
15. In Schedule 6 (capital disregards), in Part 1 (capital to be disregarded)—

(a) in paragraph 16(1)(a), after “the Caxton Foundation,” insert “the Scottish Infected Blood
Support Scheme, an approved blood scheme, the London Emergencies Trust, the We
Love Manchester Emergency Fund”;

(b) after paragraph 16, insert—
“16A. Any payment made under, or by, a trust which is approved by the Secretary of
State and which is established for the purpose of giving relief and assistance to a disabled

person whose disabilities were caused by their mother having taken a preparation
containing the drug known as Thalidomide during her pregnancy.”;
(c) in paragraph 29—
(i) in sub-paragraph (e) at the end, omit “or’”’;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (f) after “(direct payments)”, insert—

; or

(g) by virtue of regulations made under section 50 or 52 of the Social Services and
Well-being (Wales) Act 2014 (direct payments).”;

(d) after paragraph 29B, insert—
“29C.—(1) Any payment made by a local authority in accordance with section 26A of the
Children (Scotland) Act 1995 (duty to provide continuing care)(a).

(2) Any payment or part of a payment made by a local authority in accordance with that
section to a person (“A”’) which A passes on to the applicant where A—

(a) was formerly in the applicant’s care;
(b) is aged 16 or over; and
(c) continues to live with the applicant.”.
16. Schedule 8 (all applicants: matters that must be included in an Authority’s scheme — other
matters), is amended as follows—

(a) in paragraph 7 (information and evidence), in sub-paragraph (7)(a) after “the Caxton
Foundation” insert “, the London Emergencies Trust, the We Love Manchester
Emergency Fund”;

(b) in paragraph 9 (duty to notify changes of circumstances), in sub-paragraph (7)(b), after
“13 weeks” insert “or where the absence is from Great Britain, which exceeds or is likely
to exceed 4 weeks”.

(a) 1995 c.36.



Part 4

Transitional Provisions

Transitional provisions for restrictions on amounts for children and young persons

17.—(1) This regulation applies where—

(a) on 31st March 2018, a person is liable to pay council tax at a reduced rate by virtue of a
council tax reduction under an authority’s scheme established under section 13A(2) of the
Local Government Finance Act 1992 (“a section 13A(2) scheme™); and

(b) the person is, or the person and the person’s partner are between them, responsible for
more than two individuals who are either children or young persons and who are
members of the same household (each such individual is referred to as a “protected
individual”).

(2) Where this regulation applies, the amendments made by regulation 7 do not apply to the
person entitled to a council tax reduction referred to in paragraph (1) until—

(a) the person makes a new application for a reduction under an authority’s section 13A(2)
scheme; or

(b) the person or the person’s partner (if any) becomes responsible for a new individual,
whichever is the first to occur.
(3) Paragraphs (4) to (8) apply where—
(a) the amendments made by regulation 7 apply by virtue of paragraph (2)(b);
(b) the child tax credit provisions do not apply; and

(c) the person has not made a new application for a reduction under an authority’s scheme for
a reduction under an authority’s section 13A(2) scheme.

(4) Notwithstanding the default provisions, a child amount shall be included in the applicable
amount in relation to any protected individual, in relation to any time when the person or the
person’s partner (if any) is responsible for the individual and the individual is a member of the
same household.

(5) Paragraph (6) applies where—

(a) the person or the person’s partner (if any) is responsible for one or more protected
individuals who are members of the same household; and

(b) either of them is responsible for one or more new individuals who are members of the
same household.

(6) Where this paragraph applies, any protected individual for whom the person or the person’s
partner is responsible is to be counted for the purpose of deciding whether, under the default
provisions, an additional child amount is to be included in the applicable amount with respect to
the new individual or individuals referred to in paragraph (5)(b).

(7) Paragraph (8) applies where—

(a) the number of protected individuals for whom either the person or the person’s partner (if
any) is responsible, and who are members of the same household, is one;

(b) the number of new individuals for whom either the person or the person’s partner is
responsible, and who are members of the same household, is two or more; and

(c) adifferent child amount would apply to different individuals.

(8) Where this paragraph applies, the child amounts to be included in the applicable amount
shall be—

(a) the child amount in relation to the protected individual; and

(b) a child amount in relation to such one of the new individuals as will result in the greatest
possible total amount.



(9) Under paragraph (3), for the purposes of determining whether the child tax credit provisions
apply, by virtue of paragraph 6(1B) of Schedule 1 to the 2012 Regulations, where the person or
the person’s partner is responsible for one or more protected individuals, the total amount that
would be included in the applicable amount under the default provisions shall be taken to be the
total that would be included under paragraphs (4), (6) and (8).

(10) For the purposes of this regulation—

(a) “the 2012 Regulations” means the Council Tax Reduction Schemes (Prescribed
Requirements) (England) Regulations 2012;

(b) ““applicable amount”, “child”, “partner” and “young person” have the same meanings as
in the 2012 Regulations;

(c) “child amount” means the amount determined under paragraph 2 of Schedule 2 to the
2012 Regulations;

(d) “child tax credit provisions” means the provisions of paragraph 6(1)(b) of Schedule 1 to
the 2012 Regulations (as substituted by paragraph 6(1C) of that Schedule);

(e) “default provisions” means the provisions of paragraph 6(1)(b) of Schedule 1 to the 2012
Regulations (as substituted by paragraph 6(1C) of that Schedule);

(f) “new individual” means a child or young person who is not a protected individual;

(g) any reference to an individual being part of the same household means being part of the
same household with the person who is entitled to a reduction under an authority’s
section 13A(2) scheme and the person’s partner (if any);

(h) a person is to be treated as responsible for a child or young person in the circumstances
set out in regulation 7 of the 2012 Regulations.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Communities and Local Government
Marcus Jones
Parlimentary Under Secetary of State
19th December 2017 Department for Communities and Local Government

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Section 13A of the Local Government Finance Act 1992 (“the 1992 Act”) requires each billing
authority in England to make a scheme specifying the reductions which are to apply to amounts of
council tax payable by persons, or classes of person, whom the billing authority considers are in
financial need (“a council tax reduction scheme”). The Council Tax Reduction Schemes
(Prescribed Requirements) (England) Regulations 2012 (“the 2012 Regulations”) prescribe
matters which must be included in such a scheme in addition to those matters which must be
included in such a scheme by virtue of paragraph 2 of Schedule 1A to the 1992 Act.

Regulation 2 of these Regulations amends paragraph 5(2) of Schedule 1A to the 1992 Act by
changing the date by which the authority must make revisions to its scheme (or any replacement
scheme) from 31 January to 11 March in the financial year preceding the year to which the scheme
applies.

Part 3 of these Regulations amends the 2012 Regulations in consequence of changes to certain
social security legislative provisions.

The amendments made by virtue of regulations 4(a) and (d), 8(f) and (g) and 15(a) provide for the
way in which payments under the “approved blood scheme”, the “London Emergency Trust”, the
“Scottish Infected Blood Support Scheme” and the “We Love Manchester Emergency Fund” are
to be taken into account when determining eligibility for a reduction and the amount of a
reduction. Regulation 4(b) and (c) updates the definitions of “main phase employment and support
allowance” and “member of the work-related activity group”.

Regulation 5 amends the provision dealing with the concept of a “household”.

10



The amendments made by regulation 7 provide that, except where an applicant is awarded child
tax credit, the applicable amount for the applicant is to include a maximum of two amounts for
any child or young person for whom the applicant or their partner is responsible and who are
members of the same household. There are transitional provisions in regulation 17.

The figures uprated by regulations 8(a) to (e), 12 and 13 relate to non-dependant deductions
(adjustments made to the maximum amount of reduction a person can receive to take account of
adults living in the dwelling who are not dependants of the applicant); the applicable amount in
relation to an applicant for a reduction (the amount against which an applicant’s income is
compared in order to determine the amount of reduction to which he or she is entitled) and the
income bands in relation to which the amount of a person’s alternative maximum council tax
reduction is calculated.

The changes made by regulations 8(h) and 15(b) provide that payments made under or by certain
trusts established for the purpose of giving relief and assistance to disabled people whose
disabilities were caused by their mother having taken the drug known as Thalidomide during the
pregnancy are to be ignored for certain purposes.

Regulation 9 amends provisions of the 2012 Regulations that set out how the income and capital
of an applicant is calculated in deciding eligibility for a reduction, and the amount of the
reduction.

The changes made by regulations 10, 11 and 14(b) align the provisions of the 2012 Regulations
with the rising pensionable age.

Regulation 14(a) amends a provision relating to income that is to be disregarded in calculating an
applicant’s income. The changes made by regulation 15(c) and (d) provide for payments that are
to be disregarded in calculating an applicant’s capital.

Regulation 16 makes changes to provisions in Schedule 8 to the 2012 Regulations relating to the
information and evidence that must be provided with an application, and the applicant’s duty to
notify the billing authority of changes of circumstances.

An impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no impact on the private or
voluntary sectors is foreseen.

© Crown copyright 2017

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.

11



12



13



ISBN 978-0-11-116373-3

£6.00
UK201712191002 12/2017 19585

http://www legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/1305

99780111"163733
14



Appendix 2

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 422
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pensions Act 2014 (Consequential, Supplementary and
Incidental Amendments) Order 2017

Made - - - - at9.00am. on 16th March 2017
Laid before Parliament at 2.00 p.m. on 16th March 2017

Coming into force in accordance with articles 1(2), 2 and 3

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Order in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 53 and 54(5) of the Pensions Act 2014(a).

Citation and commencement
1.—(1) This Order may be cited as the Pensions Act 2014 (Consequential, Supplementary and
Incidental Amendments) Order 2017.

(2) This Order comes into force on the day on which section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014
(bereavement support payment) comes into force for all purposes (this is subject to articles 2 and
3).

Later commencement for abolition of bereavement payment and bereavement allowance
2.—(1) This Order does not come into force in accordance with article 1(2) for a person to
whom this article applies (this is subject to article 3).

(2) This article applies to a person who, on the day before the day on which section 30 of the
Pensions Act 2014 comes into force for all purposes—

(a) was entitled to—

(i) a bereavement payment under section 36 of the Social Security Contributions and
Benefits Act 1992 (bereavement payment)(b); or

(i) a bereavement allowance under section 39B of that Act (bereavement allowance
where no dependent children)(c); or

(b) would have been entitled to such a benefit if they made a claim for it.
(3) But this article ceases to apply to a person if—

(a) they were entitled to a benefit in accordance with paragraph (2)(a) and they are no longer
entitled to that benefit; or

(a) 2014 c.19.

(b) 1992 c.4. Section 36 was substituted by section 54 of the Welfare Reform and Pensions Act 1999 (c.30) and amended by
paragraph 16 of Schedule 24 to the Civil Partnership Act 2004 (c.33) and S.I.s 2014/560 and 3229 and 2016/408.

(¢) Section 39B was inserted by section 55(2) of the Welfare Reform and Pensions Act 1999 and amended by paragraph 21 of
Schedule 24 and Schedule 30 to the Civil Partnership Act 2004 and S.I.s 2014/560 and 3229.

15


wayne.hemingway_1
Typewritten Text
Appendix 2


(b) they would have been entitled to a benefit in accordance with paragraph (2)(b) and they
would no longer be entitled to that benefit if they made a claim for it.

(4) On the date this article ceases to apply to a person, this Order comes into force for that
person.

Commencement for entitlement to bereavement payment and bereavement support payment
3.—(1) This Order does not come into force in accordance with article 1(2) for a person to
whom this article applies.
(2) This article applies to a person—

(a) whose spouse or civil partner died in the 12 months before the day on which section 30 of
the Pensions Act 2014 came into force for all purposes;

(b) who would have been entitled to a bereavement payment under section 36 of the Social
Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992 if they had made a claim for it;

(¢) who formed a new marriage or civil partnership; and
(d) whose new spouse or civil partner died—

(1) on or after the day on which section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014 came into force for
all purposes; and

(i1) within 12 months of the death referred to in sub-paragraph (a).
(3) This Order comes into force for a person to whom this article applies—

(a) atthe end of the period of 12 months starting on the day on which the death referred to in
paragraph (2)(a) occurred, for the purposes of entitlement to bereavement payment for the
death referred to in paragraph (2)(a); and

(b) on the day on which section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014 comes into force for all
purposes, for the purposes of entitlement to bereavement support payment for the death
referred to in paragraph (2)(d).

Amendment of the Social Security (Credits) Regulations 1975

4.—(1) The Social Security (Credits) Regulations 1975(a) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 2(1) (interpretation)(b)—
(a) omit the definitions of “bereavement allowance” and “bereavement benefit”; and
(b) in the definition of “reckonable year”, omit “bereavement benefits,”.

(3) In regulation 3(1)(ab) (general provisions relating to the crediting of contributions and
earnings)(c), omit paragraph (iii) except for the “and” immediately after it.

(4) In regulation 4(1) (starting credits for the purposes of various benefits)(d) and in the heading
to regulation 4, omit “, a bereavement allowance”.

(5) In regulation 7A(1) (credits for carer’s allowance)(e), for “bereavement benefit” substitute
“widowed parent’s allowance”.

(6) In regulation 7C(1) (credits for working tax credit)(f), omit “, a bereavement allowance”.

(7) In regulation 8C (credits on termination of bereavement benefits)(g), after paragraph (2)
insert—

(a) S.I 1975/556.

(b) The definitions of “bereavement allowance” and “bereavement benefit” were inserted by S.I. 2000/1483. The definition of
“reckonable year” was inserted by S.I. 1996/2367 and amended by S.I.s. 2007/1749 and 2008/1554.

(¢) Regulation 3(1) was substituted by S.I. 1996/2367 and sub-paragraph (ab) was inserted by S.I. 2009/2206.

(d) Regulation 4(1) was amended by S.Ls 1988/1545, 2000/1483 and 2011/709.

(e) Regulation 7A was inserted by S.I. 1976/409 and paragraph (1) was amended by S.Ls 1987/414, 1988/1545, 2000/1483,
2002/490 and 2497, 2005/2877 and 2010/1160.

(f) Regulation 7C was inserted by S.I. 1995/2558 and paragraph (1) was amended by S.1.s 2000/1483 and 2003/455.

(g) Regulation 8C was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

16



“(3) In this regulation, “bereavement benefit” means—

(a) a bereavement payment referred to in section 36 of the Contributions and Benefits
Act as in force immediately before it was repealed by paragraph 8 of Schedule 16
to the Pensions Act 2014,

(b) a bereavement allowance referred to in section 39B of the Contributions and
Benefits Act as in force immediately before it was repealed by paragraph 13 of
Schedule 16 to the Pensions Act 2014; and

(c) widowed parent’s allowance.”.

(8) In regulation 8E(3) (credits for the purposes of entitlement to retirement pension following
official error)(a), after “bereavement allowance” insert “referred to in section 39B of the
Contributions and Benefits Act as in force immediately before it was repealed by paragraph 13 of

Schedule 16 to the Pensions Act 2014”.

(9) In regulation 8G(2) (credits for persons entitled to universal credit)(b), omit sub-paragraph
(d).
(10) In regulation 9F (credits for persons providing care for a child under the age of 12)(¢c)—

(a) in paragraph (2)(b), omit “or bereavement allowance”’; and

(b) omit paragraph (3)(e).

Amendment of the Social Security Benefit (Persons Abroad) Regulations 1975
5.—(1) The Social Security Benefit (Persons Abroad) Regulations 1975(d) are amended as

follows.

(2) In regulation 1(2) (interpretation)(e), omit the definitions of “bereavement allowance”,
“bereavement benefit” and “bereavement payment”.

(3) In regulation 4(1) (modification of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act
1992)(f) and in the heading to regulation 4, for “bereavement benefit” substitute “widowed
parent’s allowance”.

(4) Omit regulation 4(2B)(g).

(5) In regulation 5(3)(d) (application of disqualification in respect of up-rating of benefit)(h), for
“bereavement benefit” substitute “widowed parent’s allowance”.

(6) In regulation 5A (rate of guaranteed minimum pension)(i), omit “, bereavement allowance”.

Amendment of the Social Security (Overlapping Benefits) Regulations 1979
6.—(1) The Social Security (Overlapping Benefits) Regulations 1979(j) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 2(1) (interpretation)(k), omit the definition of “bereavement allowance”.

(3) In the Schedule (personal benefits which are required to be adjusted)(l) in paragraph 3 of
column (1), omit “, bereavement allowance”.

(a) Regulation 8E was inserted by S.I. 2007/2582.
(b) Regulation 8G was inserted by S.1. 2013/630.

Regulation 9F was inserted by S.I. 2011/709.

(d) S.I.1975/563.

The definitions of “bereavement allowance” and “bereavement benefit” were inserted by S.I. 2000/2876 and the definition
of “bereavement payment” was inserted by S.I. 2001/2618.
Regulation 4(1) was amended by S.I. 1992/1700, 2000/2876 (as was the heading to regulation 4) and 2005/1551.

(g) Paragraph (2B) was inserted by S.I. 2000/2876 and amended by S.1.s 2001/2618, 2005/2877 and 2010/788.
(h) Regulation 5(3)(d) was amended by S.Ls 1989/1642, 2000/2876 and 2005/2877.

Regulation 5A was inserted by S.I. 1990/621 and amended by S.1. 2000/2876.
S.1. 1979/597.

(k) The definition of “bereavement allowance” was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

Paragraph 3 of column 1 was amended by S.1. 2000/1483.

17



Amendment of the Social Security (Widow’s Benefit and Retirement Pensions) Regulations
1979

7.—(1) The Social Security (Widow’s Benefit and Retirement Pensions) Regulations 1979(a)
are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 1(2) (interpretation)(b) in the definition of “bereavement allowance”, insert at
the end “(as in force immediately before it was repealed by paragraph 13 of Schedule 16 to the
Pensions Act 2014)”.

(3) In regulation 6(1) (rate of benefit where the second contribution condition is not satisfied)(c),
omit sub-paragraph (ab).

(4) After regulation 7A (Category B retirement pension for surviving spouses and surviving civil
partners)(d), insert—

“Notional entitlement to Category B retirement pension for new State Pension
purposes

7B.—(1) This regulation applies for the purposes of determining whether, in accordance
with paragraph 3(1)(d) of Schedule 3 to the Pensions Act 2014 (survivor’s pension
inherited amount: dead spouse or civil partner in old state pension scheme)(e), a person
(“the pensioner”’) would have been entitled to a Category B retirement pension.

(2) The pensioner shall be treated as being entitled to bereavement support payment if the
pensioner would have been so entitled but for one or both of the circumstances specified in
paragraph (3).

(3) The circumstances referred to in paragraph (2) are—

(a) the pensioner’s failure to make, or the pensioner’s delay in making, a claim for that
bereavement support payment;

(b) the operation of section 32 of the Pensions Act 2014 (bereavement support
payment: prisoners) or any regulations made under that section.”.

Amendment of the Social Security (General Benefit) Regulations 1982
8.—(1) The Social Security (General Benefit) Regulations 1982(f) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 1(2) (interpretation)(g), omit the definition of “bereavement benefit”.

(3) In regulation 2(2) (exceptions from disqualification for imprisonment etc.)(h), for
“bereavement benefit” substitute “widowed parent’s allowance”.

Amendment of the Income Support (General) Regulations 1987

9.—(1) The Income Support (General) Regulations 1987(i) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 2(1) (interpretation) in the definition of “the benefits Acts”(j), for “Part 1 of the
Pensions Act 2014” substitute ‘“Parts 1 and 5 of the Pensions Act 2014”.

(3) In Schedule 9 (sums to be disregarded in the calculation of income other than earnings)(k),
after paragraph 79 insert—

(a) S.I. 1979/642.

(b) The definition of “bereavement allowance” was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

(¢) Sub-paragraph (ab) was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

(d) Regulation 7A was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483 and amended by S.I. 2005/2877.

(e) See S.I. 2016/408 for transitional provisions relating to paragraph 3 of Schedule 3.

® S.I. 1982/1408.

(g) The definition of “bereavement benefit” was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

(h) The words “bereavement benefit” were inserted into regulation 2 by S.I. 2000/1483.

(i) S.I. 1987/1967.

(j) The definition of “the benefits Acts” was inserted by S.I. 1996/206 and amended by S.L.s 2008/1554, 2013/388 and
2015/1985.

(k) Paragraph 79 of Schedule 9 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

18



“80. Any bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014
(bereavement support payment) except any such payment which is disregarded as capital
under paragraph 7(1)(f) or 72 of Schedule 10.”.

(4) In Schedule 10 (capital to be disregarded)(a)—
(a) in paragraph 7(1), after paragraph (e) insert—
“(f) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014,”; and
(b) after paragraph 71, insert—
“72. Any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2) or

(5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement support
payment)(b), but only for a period of 52 weeks from the date of receipt of the payment.”.

Amendment of the Social Security (Claims and Payments) Regulations 1987
10.—(1) The Social Security (Claims and Payments) Regulations 1987(c) are amended as
follows.
(2) In regulation 2 (interpretation)(d)—
(a) in paragraph (1)—

(i) for the definitions of “bereavement allowance” and ‘“bereavement benefit”
substitute—

““bereavement benefit” means—

(a) a bereavement payment referred to in section 36 of the Contributions and Benefits
Act as in force immediately before it was repealed by paragraph 8 of Schedule 16
to the Pensions Act 2014,

(b) a bereavement allowance referred to in section 39B of the Contributions and
Benefits Act as in force immediately before it was repealed by paragraph 13 of
Schedule 16 to the Pensions Act 2014; and

(c) widowed parent’s allowance;

“bereavement support payment” means bereavement support payment under section 30
of the Pensions Act 2014;”;

(i1) in the definition of “long-term benefits”, omit “bereavement allowance,”; and
(iii) in the definition of “working age benefit”, omit paragraph (a); and

(b) in paragraph (2)(b), after “a shared additional pension” insert “, bereavement support
payment”.

(3) In regulation 3(1) (claims not required for entitlement to benefit in certain cases)(e)—
(a) for sub-paragraph (a)(iv), substitute—
“(iv) widowed parent’s allowance;”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (d)(ii), omit “or bereavement allowance”; and

(c) omit sub-paragraph (da).

(a) Paragraph 7(1) of Schedule 10 was numbered as paragraph 7(1) by S.I. 2002/2380 and paragraph 7(1)(e) was inserted by
S.I. 2013/630. Paragraph 71 of Schedule 10 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

(b) S.1.2017/410.

(c) S.I. 1987/1968. Those Regulations were revoked by S.I. 2003/492 for the purposes of child benefit and guardian’s
allowance.

(d) The definitions of “bereavement allowance” and “bereavement benefits” were inserted by S.I. 2000/1483. The words
“bereavement allowance” were inserted into the definition of “long-term benefits” by S.I. 2000/1483. The definition of
“working age benefit” was inserted by S.I. 2009/3229.

(e) Paragraph (1) of regulation 3 was numbered as paragraph (1) by S.I. 2015/437. Regulation 3(1)(a)(iv) was inserted by S.L
2000/1483.

19



(4) In regulation 4 (making a claim for benefit)(a)—

(a) in paragraph (6A)(a)(i), for “a bereavement benefit” substitute “widowed parent’s
allowance”; and

(b) for paragraph (11)(e), substitute—
“(e) widowed parent’s allowance;
(ea) bereavement support payment;”.
(5) In regulation 4ZC(2) (electronic claims for benefit)(b), after sub-paragraph (b) insert—
“(ba) bereavement support payment;”.

(6) In regulation 16 (date of entitlement under an award for the purpose of payability of benefit
and effective date of change of rate)(c)—

(a) in paragraph (2A), omit “bereavement allowance,”;

(b) in paragraph (3)(c)(i), for “bereavement allowance” substitute “bereavement support
payment”; and

(c) in paragraph (4), for “bereavement allowance” substitute “bereavement support
payment”.

(7) In regulation 19 (time for claiming benefit)(d)—
(a) for paragraph (3)(ga), substitute—
“(ga) subject to paragraph (3B), widowed parent’s allowance;
(gb) subject to paragraph (3BA), bereavement support payment;”;
(b) omit paragraph (3A);

(c) in paragraph (3B), for “a bereavement benefit” substitute “widowed parent’s allowance”;
and

(d) after paragraph (3B), insert—
“(3BA) The prescribed time for claiming bereavement support payment in respect of—

(a) the rate set out in regulation 3(2) or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment
Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement support payment); and

(b) the date on which the claimant’s spouse or civil partner died,
is 12 months beginning with that date of death.”.

(8) In regulation 22A(1) (bereavement allowance, widowed mother’s allowance, widowed
parent’s allowance and widow’s pension)(e) and in the heading to regulation 22A, omit
“bereavement allowance,”.

(9) Omit—

(a) “bereavement allowance,” in the heading to regulation 22B (payment of bereavement
allowance, widowed mother’s allowance, widowed parent’s allowance and widow’s
pension at a daily rate)(f);

(b) “bereavement allowance or” in regulation 22B(1); and
(c) regulation 22B(5)(a).

(a) Regulation 4(6A) was inserted by S.I. 2003/1632 and the introductory words of paragraph (6A) were amended by S.L
2007/2911. Regulation 4(11) was inserted by S.I. 2005/34 and substituted by S.I. 2016/544.

(b) Regulation 4ZC was inserted by S.I. 2003/2800 and paragraph (2) was substituted by S.I. 2016/544.

(c) Regulation 16(2A) was inserted by S.I. 2009/604. Regulation 16(3) was substituted by S.I. 1988/522 and sub-paragraph (c)
was substituted by S.I. 2009/604. The words “bereavement allowance” were inserted into regulation 16(4) by S.I. 2009/604.

(d) Regulation 19 was substituted by S.I. 1997/793. Regulation 19(3)(ga) was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483 and substituted by S.I.
2005/777. Paragraph (3A) was inserted by S.I. 2002/2660 and amended by S.I. 2005/777. Paragraph (3B) was inserted by
S.1. 2005/777.

(e) Regulation 22A was inserted by S.1. 2009/604.

(f) Regulation 22B was inserted by S.I. 2009/604.

20



(10) In regulation 32ZA(2) (information given electronically)(a), after sub-paragraph (a)
insert—

“(aa) bereavement support payment;”.

(11) In regulation 32B(3) (information relating to awards of benefit)(b), omit sub-paragraphs (b)
and (¢).

(12) In Part 1 of Schedule 1 (benefit claimed and other benefit which may be treated as if
claimed in addition or in the alternative)(c)—

(a) in column (1)—
(1) after the entry for “working families’ tax credit”, insert “bereavement benefit”; and
(ii) after that new entry, insert “bereavement support payment”; and

(b) in column (2)—

(1) after the entry for “disabled person’s tax credit”’, insert “bereavement support
payment”’; and

(ii) after that new entry, insert “bereavement benefit”.

(13) In Schedule 7 (time of payment and commencement of entitlement in income support
cases)(d), for “bereavement benefit” substitute “widowed parent’s allowance” in the following
places—

(a) paragraph 2(c);
(b) paragraph 2ZA; and
(c) paragraph 4 in the definition of “relevant social security benefit”.

(14) In paragraph 2(1) of Schedule 9ZC (conditions for the use of electronic communication)(e),
after paragraph (b) insert—

“(ba) bereavement support payment;”.

Amendment of the Social Fund (Recovery by Deductions from Benefits) Regulations 1988

11. In regulation 3 of the Social Fund (Recovery by Deductions from Benefits) Regulations
1988 (benefits from which an award may be recovered)(f), omit paragraph (ff).

Amendment of the Child Support (Maintenance Assessments and Special Cases) Regulations
1992

12.In Schedule 2 to the Child Support (Maintenance Assessments and Special Cases)
Regulations 1992 (amounts to be disregarded when calculating or estimating N and M)(g), after
paragraph 7A insert—

“7TB. Any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act
2014.”.

(a) Regulation 32ZA was inserted by S.I. 2003/2800 and paragraph (2) was substituted by S.I. 2001/1498.

(b) Regulation 32B was inserted by S.I. 2007/2911.

(c) The entry for “working families’ tax credit” in column (1) was given that label by S.I. 1999/2572 and the entry for “disabled
person’s tax credit” in column (2) was given that label by S.I. 1999/2572.

(d) In paragraphs 2(c) and 4, the words “bereavement benefit” were inserted by S.I. 2000/1483. Paragraph 2ZA was inserted by
S.1. 2009/604.

(e) Schedule 9ZC was inserted by S.I. 2003/2800. Paragraph 2(1) was substituted by S.I. 2016/544.

(f) S.1. 1988/35. Paragraph (ff) was inserted by S.I. 2000/3223.

(g) S.I. 1992/1815. Paragraph 7A was inserted by S.I. 2013/630. S.I. 1992/1815 was revoked for some cases by S.I. 2012/2785.

21



Amendment of the Social Security (Payments on account, Overpayments and Recovery)
Regulations 1988

13.—(1) The Social Security (Payments on account, Overpayments and Recovery) Regulations
1998(a) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 1(2) (interpretation)(b), omit the definitions of “bereavement benefit” and
“bereavement payment”.

(3) In regulation 8(1) (duplication and prescribed payments)(c), for sub-paragraph (i)
substitute—

“(1) any widowed parent’s allowance under section 39A of the Contributions and
Benefits Act;”.

Amendment of the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations 1996

14.—(1) The Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations 1996(d) are amended as follows.
(2) In Schedule 7 (sums to be disregarded in the calculation of income other than earnings)(e),
after paragraph 75 insert—

“76. Any bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014
(bereavement support payment) except any such payment which is disregarded as capital
under paragraph 12(1)(e) or 65 of Schedule 8.”.

(3) In Schedule 8 (capital to be disregarded)(f)—
(a) in paragraph 12(1), after paragraph (d) insert—
“(e) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014,”; and
(b) after paragraph 64, insert—
“65. Any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2) or

(5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement support
payment), but only for a period of 52 weeks from the date of receipt of the payment.”.

Amendment of the Social Security and Child Support (Decisions and Appeals) Regulations
1999

15.—(1) The Social Security and Child Support (Decisions and Appeals) Regulations 1999(g)
are amended as follows.
(2) In regulation 1(3) (interpretation)(h)—
(a) omit the definitions of “bereavement allowance” and “bereavement payment”’; and
(b) in the definition of “bereavement benefit”, for paragraphs (a) and (b) substitute—
“(a) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014; or”.
(3) In regulation 3 (revision of decisions)(i)—

(a) in paragraph (5ZB), after sub-paragraph (a) insert—

(a) S.I. 1988/664. Those Regulations were revoked by S.I. 2003/492 for the purposes of child benefit and guardian’s allowance.

(b) The definitions of “bereavement benefit” and “bereavement payment” were inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

(¢) Regulation 8(1)(i) was inserted by S.I. 2000/1483.

(d) S.I 1996/207.

(e) Paragraph 75 of Schedule 7 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

(f)  Sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 was numbered as sub-paragraph (1) by S.I. 2002/2380. Paragraph 12(1)(d) was inserted
by S.I. 2001/2333. Paragraph 64 of Schedule 8 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

(g) S.I.1999/991.

(h) The definitions of “bereavement allowance”, “bereavement benefit” and “bereavement payment” were inserted by S.L
2016/1145.

(i) Regulation 3(5ZB) was inserted by S.I. 2007/2582. Regulation 3(8G) was inserted by S.I. 2016/1145. Regulation 3 was
revoked by S.I. 2003/916 for the purposes of child benefit and guardian’s allowance.

22



“(aa) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014;”; and
(b) in paragraph (8G)—

(i) in column 1 of the table, for “Bereavement allowance” substitute ‘“Bereavement
support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014”;

(i1) in column 2 of the table, for the corresponding entry to “Bereavement support
payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014” (as inserted by paragraph (i))
substitute “the contribution conditions set out in section 31 of the Pensions Act 2014
(bereavement support payment: contribution condition and amendments)”’; and

(iii) omit the row with “Bereavement payment” in column 1.

Amendment of the Social Security (Claims and Information) Regulations 1999
16. In regulation 4(4) of the Social Security (Claims and Information) Regulations 1999
(additional functions of local authorities)(a), after sub-paragraph (e) insert—

“(ea) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014;”.

Amendment of the Child Support (Maintenance Calculations and Special Cases) Regulations
2000

17. In regulation 4(1)(a) of the Child Support (Maintenance Calculations and Special Cases)
Regulations 2000 (flat rate)(b), omit paragraph (i).

Amendment of the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001
18. In regulation 49 of the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001 (precluded Class 3
contributions)(¢)—
(a) in paragraph (2)—
(i) in sub-paragraph (a), omit *“, bereavement allowance”; and
(ii) in sub-paragraph (b), omit “bereavement payment or”’; and

(b) in paragraph (3), omit “, bereavement allowance”.

Amendment of the Social Security (Inherited SERPS) Regulations 2001
19.In regulation 2(3)(a) of the Social Security (Inherited SERPS) Regulations 2001
(modification of Part II of the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992)(d)—
(a) omit “and bereavement allowance”; and

(b) omit “except in so far as that section relates to the rate of a bereavement allowance”.

Amendment of the Social Security (Loss of Benefit) Regulations 2001
20. In regulation 19 of the Social Security (Loss of Benefit) Regulations 2001 (social security
benefits not to be sanctionable benefits)(e), for paragraph (e) substitute—

“(e) bereavement support payment payable under section 30 of the Pensions Act
2014. 7.

(a) S.I. 1999/3108.

(b) S.I. 2001/155. Those Regulations were revoked for some cases by S.I. 2012/2785.

(¢) S.I. 2001/1004. Regulation 49(2) was amended by S.I. 2001/3728. In regulation 49(3), the words “bereavement allowance”
were inserted by S.I. 2001/3728.

(d) S.I.2001/1085

(e) S.I.2001/4022.

23



Amendment of the State Pension Credit Regulations 2002

21.—(1) The State Pension Credit Regulations 2002(a) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 15(1) (income for the purposes of the State Pension Credit Act 2002)(b), for
sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014;”.

(3) In Part 1 of Schedule V (income from capital: capital disregarded for the purpose of
calculating income)(c)—

(a) in paragraph 20(2), after paragraph (p) insert—
“(q) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014.”; and
(b) after paragraph 23D, insert—
“23E. A payment of bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in
regulation 3(2) or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of

bereavement support payment), but only for a period of 52 weeks from the date of receipt
of the payment.”.

Amendment of the Tax Credits (Definition and Calculation of Income) Regulations 2002

22. In regulation 7(3) of the Tax Credits (Definition and Calculation of Income) Regulations
2002 (social security income)(d) in Table 3, for row 3 substitute “3 A bereavement support
payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014.”.

Amendment of the Non-Contentious Probate Fees Order 2004
23.In Schedule 1A to the Non-Contentious Probate Fees Order 2004 (remissions and part
remissions)(e)—
(a) 1in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(1) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and

(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

Amendment of the Social Fund Maternity and Funeral Expenses (General) Regulations 2005

24. In regulation 10(1A) of the Social Fund Maternity and Funeral Expenses (General)
Regulations 2005 (deductions from an award of a funeral payment)(f), for sub-paragraph (b)
substitute—

“(b) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014;”.

Amendment of the Housing Benefit Regulations 2006
25.—(1) The Housing Benefit Regulations 2006(g) are amended as follows.

(a) S.I1.2002/1792.

(b) Regulation 15(1)(n) was inserted by S.I. 2002/3019.

(¢) Paragraph 20(2)(p) of Schedule V was inserted by S.I. 2013/630. Paragraph 23D was inserted by S.1. 2016/732.

(d) S.1.2002/2006.

(e) S.I. 2004/3120. Schedule 1A was inserted by S.I. 2013/2302. The definition of “excluded benefit” was substituted by S.L
2014/590.

(f) S.I. 2005/3061. Regulation 10(1A) was inserted by S.1. 2013/247.

(g) S.1.2006/213.

10

24



(2) In Schedule 5 (sums to be disregarded in the calculation of income other than earnings)(a),
after paragraph 66 insert—

“67. Any bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014
(bereavement support payment) except any such payment which is disregarded as capital
under paragraph 9(1)(h) or 62 of Schedule 6.”.

(3) In Schedule 6 (capital to be disregarded)(b)—
(a) in paragraph 9(1), after paragraph (g) insert—
“(h) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014,”; and
(b) after paragraph 61, insert—
“62. Any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2) or

(5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement support
payment), but only for a period of 52 weeks from the date of receipt of the payment.”.

Amendment of the Housing Benefit (Persons who have attained the qualifying age for State
Pension Credit) Regulations 2006

26.—(1) The Housing Benefit (Persons who have attained the qualifying age for State Pension
Credit) Regulations 2006(c) are amended as follows.
(2) In regulation 29(1)(j) (meaning of income), for paragraph (xiii) substitute—
“(xiil) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014;”.
(3) In Part 1 of Schedule 6 (capital to be disregarded generally)(d)—
(a) in paragraph 21(2), after paragraph (o) insert—
“(p) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014.”; and
(b) after paragraph 26G, insert—
“26H. A payment of bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in
regulation 3(2) or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of

bereavement support payment), but only for a period of 52 weeks from the date of receipt
of the payment.”.

Amendment of the Gender Recognition (Application Fees) Order 2006
27. In the Schedule to the Gender Recognition (Application Fees) Order 2006 (remissions and
part remissions)(e)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(i) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and
(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

(a) Paragraph 66 of Schedule 5 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

(b) Paragraph 9(1)(g) of Schedule 6 was inserted by S.I. 2013/630 and paragraph 61 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

(¢) S.1.2006/214.

(d) Paragraph 21(2)(o) of Schedule 6 was inserted by S.I. 2013/630 and paragraph 26G was inserted by S.I. 2016/732.

(e) S.I. 2006/758. The Schedule was inserted by S.I. 2013/2302. The definition of “excluded benefits” was substituted by S.L
2014/590.

11

25



Amendment of the Transfer of State Pensions and Benefits Regulations 2007
28.—(1) The Transfer of State Pensions and Benefits Regulations 2007(a) are amended as
follows.

(2) In regulation 1(2) (interpretation)(b) in the definition of “relevant benefit”, after paragraph
(ba) insert—

“(bb) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014 or
section 29 of the Pensions Act (Northern Ireland) 2015(c);”.

(3) In regulation 8(3) (effect of making a cash equivalent transfer payment)(d), after “Part 1” in
both places it occurs insert “or Part 5”.

Amendment of the Court of Protection Fees Order 2007
29.In Schedule 2 to the Court of Protection Fees Order 2007 (remissions and part
remissions)(e)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(i) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and

(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

Amendment of the Social Security (Claims and Information) Regulations 2007
30. In regulation 1(3) of the Social Security (Claims and Information) Regulations 2007
(interpretation)(f) in the definition of “specified benefit”, for paragraphs (b) and (c) substitute—

“(b) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014;”.

Amendment of the Employment and Support Allowance Regulations 2008
31.—(1) The Employment and Support Allowance Regulations 2008(g) are amended as follows.

(2) In regulation 165(3) (entitlement for less than a week — amount of an employment and
support allowance payable) in the definition of “Y”, for “bereavement allowance” substitute
“bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014”.

(3) In regulation 167(d) (modification in the calculation of income), for ‘“bereavement
allowance” substitute ‘“bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014”.

(4) In Schedule 8 (sums to be disregarded in the calculation of income other than earnings)(h),
after paragraph 67 insert—

“68. Any bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014 except
any such payment which is disregarded as capital under paragraph 11(1)(d) or 60 of
Schedule 9. .

(5) In Schedule 9 (capital to be disregarded)(i)—

(a) S.I1.2007/1398.

(b) Paragraph (ba) of the definition of “relevant benefit” was inserted by S.I. 2015/1985.

(¢) 2015cs5.

(d) The words “Part 1”” were inserted by S.I. 2015/1985.

(e) S.I. 2007/1745. Schedule 2 was inserted by S.I. 2013/2302. The definition of “excluded benefits” was substituted by S.L
2014/590.

() S.1.2007/2911.

(g) S.1.2008/794.

(h) Paragraph 67 of Schedule 8 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

(i) Paragraph 59 of Schedule 9 was inserted by S.I. 2014/2103.

12

26



(a) in paragraph 11(1), after paragraph (c) insert—
“(d) bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions Act 2014,”; and
(b) after paragraph 59, insert—
“60. Any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2) or

(5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement support
payment), but only for a period of 52 weeks from the date of receipt of the payment.”.

Amendment of the Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008
32.In Schedule 2 to the Magistrates’ Courts Fees Order 2008 (remissions and part
remissions)(a)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(i) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and

(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

Amendment of the Civil Proceedings Fees Order 2008
33.In Schedule 2 to the Civil Proceedings Fees Order 2008 (remissions and part
remissions)(b)—
(a) 1in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(1) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and

(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

Amendment of the Family Proceedings Fees Order 2008
34.In Schedule 2 to the Family Proceedings Fees Order 2008 (remissions and part
remissions)(c)—
(a) 1in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(1) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and
(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

(a) S.I. 2008/1052. Schedule 2 was inserted by S.I. 2013/2302. The definition of “excluded benefits” was substituted by S.L
2014/590.

(b) S.I. 2008/1053. Schedule 2 was inserted by S.I. 2013/2302. The definition of “excluded benefits” was substituted by S.L
2014/590.

(¢) S.I. 2008/1054. Schedule 2 was inserted by S.I. 2013/2302. The definition of “excluded benefits” was substituted by S.I.
2014/590.

13

27



Amendment of the Upper Tribunal (Lands Chamber) Fees Order 2009
35. In Schedule 2 to the Upper Tribunal (Lands Chamber) Fees Order 2009 (remissions and part
remissions)(a)—
(a) in paragraph 1(1), for paragraph (i) of the definition of “excluded benefits” substitute—

“(1) any payment of bereavement support payment under section 30 of the Pensions
Act 2014;”; and

(b) in paragraph 10, for sub-paragraph (n) substitute—

“(n) any bereavement support payment in respect of the rate set out in regulation 3(2)
or (5) of the Bereavement Support Payment Regulations 2017 (rate of bereavement
support payment);”.

Amendment of the Supreme Court Fees Order 2009

36. In Schedule 2 to the Supreme Court Fees Order 2009 (remissions and part remissions)(b)—
(a) 